
becoming a volunteer please 
contact City Hall before January 
12th at (325) 473-3501.

22-6tc

The Bronte Economic 
Development Corporation is 
looking for individuals to serve 
as Board Members. The ideal 
candidates will have experience 
in business, tourism, and/or 
economic development, coupled 
with vision and commitment to 
ensure our community’s 

You may place a bid online at 
www.texascg.com or www.bronte 
texas.org or you can simply go to 
Bronte City Hall and submit a 
bid, which is the price you would 
consider paying for the property 
you wish to buy. Should you 
meet the requirements listed 
above and your bid is sufficient 
and accepted by all entities, we 
will then send the deed to be 
recorded. The recorded deed 
will then be forwarded to the 
individual at the address that 
accompanied your successful 
bid.

24-4tc

Bronte ISD will hold a public 
meeting at 6:15 pm, January 24, 
2018, in the Board Room, 
Bronte ISD, 210 S. Jefferson, 
Bronte, TX, CITY.  The 
purpose of  this meeting is to 
discuss Bronte ISD rating on the 
state’s Texas Academic 
Performance Report (TAPR).

26-2tc

Applications for candidates to 
apply for a position on the 
Robert Lee ISD Board of  
Trustees may be picked up at the 
Robert Lee ISD Administration 
Office beginning Wednesday, 
January 17, 2018, during the 
hours of  8 am - 3:30 pm, 
Monday through Friday. The 
deadline for filing a candidate 
application is Friday, February 
16, 2018, at 5 pm. Election Day 
will be Saturday, May 5, 2018. 
Requirements for filing are that 
you must have lived in thestate 
for one year and six months in 
the school district prior to filing, 
be at least 18 years of  age, and 
be a registered voter at time of  
election. Robert Lee ISD will 
need to elect three places for full 
three year terms. The three year 
terms of  George Grim, Tom 
Sawyer Jr., and Wes Washam are 
expiring.

26-2tc

Bronte ISD will hold a public 
meeting at 6:30 pm, January 24, 
2018, in the Board Room, 
Bronte ISD, 210 S. Jefferson, 
Bronte, TX, CITY.  The 
purpose of  this meeting is to 
discuss Bronte ISD rating on the 
state’s financial accountability 
system.

26-2tc

The Bronte EDC has a 
voluntary position available to 
provide assistance to the EDC 
President, Secretary and 
Treasurer. Individual must have 
experience taking minutes and 
finances. If  you are interested in 
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If  you would like to submit your 
name for consideration for a 
term appointment as a Board 
Member of  the Bronte EDC, 
please contact City Hall before 
January 12th at (325) 473-3501.

22-6tc

Only Coke County residents 
may lease any of  the Coke 
County facilities listed  below.

Lessee must pay a Security 
Deposit of  $500.00   

Large Recreation Halls – The 

Rental Rate is $100.00 for a full 
day or $50.00 for a  half  day 
(anything over six hours is 
considered a full day)

Senior Citizen Buildings – The 
Rental Rate is $50.00 for a full 
day or $25.00 for a half  day 
(anything over six hours is 
considered a full day)

Pavilions – The Rental Rate is 
$25.00 per day if  Lessee uses 
electricity, otherwise  no charge 
(no half  day rate available)    

Contact the County Judge’s 
Office at 325-453-2641 for more 
information. 

26-2tc


