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dog has been certified as a 
‘Canine Good Citizen’ and is 
trained to calmly be around 
people of  all ages and 
disabilities.

The first visit will be on 
Tuesday, January 25, at 11 am.  
Bow, a 9 year old rescue Boxer 
from PAWS in San Angelo will 
be the guest canine.  Bow loves 
to snuggle up with a warm 
blanket and naps.

The West Coke County 
Hospital District Board will 
meet on Tuesday, January 25, at 

noon, pot luck gathering.  
District president Dr. Janis 
Petronis will be present.   If  you 
are a Texas public school 
employee retiree or a friend, you 
are encouraged to attend.

The January meeting of  the 
Friends of  the Robert Lee Care 
Center will be held on Monday, 
January 24, at 10 am in the new 
West Coke County Hospital 
District board room (located 
across the street from RLCC, in 
the same building as the Coke 
County Food Pantry.  Anyone 
wishing to support the goal of  
enhancing the lives of  the Care 
Center residents is welcome to 
attend.

The Coke County Library will 
be hosting ‘Canine 
Companions’.  Each month, one 
canine companion will visit the 
library and kids can come visit, 
read to the dog, ask questions, or 
just curl up and snuggle.  Each 

The 83rd edition of  the 
Coke County Junior Livestock 
Show will be held Friday, 
January 14, and Saturday, 
January 16, at the Sterling 
Lindsey Exhibition Building in 
Robert Lee.

The event will begin on 
Friday with official weigh in of  
animals at 10 am in the 
following order:  steers, pigs, 
lambs, goats, rabbits.  The 
market steer show will then 
begin at 5 pm.

The show will begin on 
Saturday at 8:30 am with the 
market pig show, followed by 
the pig pee wee showmanship, 
market lamb show, market goat 
show, lamb and goat pee wee 
showmanship, and rabbit show 
in that order.  The premium 
sale will be held then at 1 pm.

Barn cleanup will be held on 
Sunday at 2 pm and all 
exhibitors are asked to please 

help clean up the barns and 
pens.

One Another Robert Lee will 
begin delivering groceries on 
January 20, 2022, to senior 
citizens, those who are home 
bound, disabled citizens and 
housing authority residents.  
There will be no delivery charge, 
but groceries must be ordered 
from HEB and prepaid online.

If  those needing this service 
are unfamiliar with ordering 
online, assistance is also 
available with that part of  the 
process.  

Spots for delivery will be 
limited for the first few trips.  
Call (435) 817-1322.

The Coke County Retired 
Teachers will meet Monday, 
January 17, 2022 at the First 
Baptist Church in Bronte for a 

9:30 am at the WCCHD Board 
Room, 722 Washington in 
Robert Lee.

The annual Daddy-Daughter 
Date Night will be held 
Saturday, February 5, from 5 pm 
until 8 pm at the Robert Lee 
First United Methodist Church 
Family Life Center.  Tickets are 
available in advance through 
February 3 in Robert Lee at 
Austin St. Coffee Shop and in 
Bronte at Blackburn’s Ranch 
and Hardware Supply.  Tickets 
will also be available at the door.


