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In 1957 the North Port Arthur 

Lions Club had a naming 
contest, and 6-year-old Christy 
McClintock submitted the 
winning entry - Rainbow 
Bridge.  She said it looked like a 
mechanical rainbow.  You will 
agree if  you are there near 
sunset and see it illuminated in 
the shimmering hues of  the 
evening. McClintock earned a 
$50 U.S. savings bond as her 
prize.

Why was the bridge, with 177 
feet of  vertical clearance, built 
so tall?  It crossed an important 
ship channel and builders 
wanted the tallest ship in the 
Navy at the time, the USS 
Patoka, to be able to pass easily 
beneath it, pulling a dirigible.

The Rainbow Bridge was 
more than an engineering 
marvel.  It was also a magnet for 
teenagers in the night.  The high 
school kids in the area used to 
climb up into the catwalks. One 
of  those students was destined 
for worldwide fame.  It is said 
that she used to sit up there high 
above the moonlit waters of  the 
Neches River and sing in her 
passionately raw style.  I’m sure 
you’ve heard of  her.  Janis 
Joplin?  Her biographer, Myra 
Friedman, said Joplin would sing 
up there under the great Texas 
sky and “scorch the stars.” But 
that’s a whole other story.

The tallest ship in the Navy 
never did pass beneath the 
Rainbow Bridge.  Seems a 
shame. Somewhat like a bride 
having planned a perfect 
wedding, but the groom never 
showed.

W.F. Strong is a professor at 
the University of  Texas Rio 
Grande Valley and first wrote 
this story for Texas Standard 
and also appeared in Texas Co-
Op Power magazine.


