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in advance through Friday, 
November 4, by calling or 
texting (text preferred) 806-445-
3089.  Just give the name of  the 
contact person and where and 
what time.

Robert Lee ISD will hold their 
Thanksgiving meal on 
Wednesday, November 16, from 
11 am until 1 pm in the 
cafeteria.  There will be no 
charge for RLISD students and 
the event is open to the public.

Please RSVP by November 11 
to Samantha Burns at 
samantha.burns@rlisd.net or 
453-4555.

The annual Veterans Day 
Program sponsored by Robert 
Lee ISD will be held on Friday, 
November 11, at 9:30 am in the 

any club member or they can be 
purchased at the door.  The club 
members are excited to be able 
to host this fundraiser again this 
year and look forward to seeing 
all of  their old friends and to 
make some new ones, too.  
There will be deliveries to the 
school, downtown, nursing 
home, and the courthouse.  For 
those who cannot stay, to-go 
containers will be available.

This is the club’s main 
fundraiser for the year and uses 
the money to help projects in 
our community.

If  you have questions or need 
to order tickets, you can call 
Janet Wommack  at (325) 725-
8288.

The Friends of  the Robert 
Lee Care Center Brown Bag 
Fundraiser will be held on 
Thursday, November 10, at 11 
am at the Methodist Family Life 
Center.  The lunch will include a 
pulled pork sandwich, chips and 
dessert and will be available for 
in person pickup beginning at 11 
am. Orders may also be placed 

Bronte Church of  Christ will 
host a Trunk or Treat event on 
Sunday, October 30, from 5:30 
pm until 7:30 pm.  Bring your 
kiddos by to get some treats!

Robert Lee First United 
Methodist Church will host 
their Trunk or Treat event on 
Monday, October 31, 
beginning at 6 pm.  The 
evening will include treats, hot 
dogs, and drinks in the Family 
Life Center parking lot.

Robert Lee ISD will hold a 
FAFSA night for the senior class 
of  2023 on Monday, November 
7, from 6 pm until 7:30 pm in 
the RLHS library.  This event is 
a requirement for graduation.

Attendees should bring the 
following:  student’s social 
security number/DACA 
number; student’s driver license 
(if  any); student’s (and spouse’s, 

if  married) federal income tax 
return for 2021; parent’s federal 
income tax return for 2021; and 
parent’s and student’s alien 
registration card (if  not a US 
citizen).

Prior to the meeting, parents 
need to create an ID/username 
and password for the student 
and parent.  This can be done at 
www.fafsa.gov.

The Sorosis Study Club will 
hold their annual potato bake 
luncheon on Tuesday, November 
8, at the Bronte First United 
Methodist Church fellowship 
hall.  The meal will be held from 
11 am until 1 pm.  The menu 
includes all of  the “usuals” - 
baked potatoes with cheese, 
butter, sour cream, bacon, chili, 
fruit salads, corn-frito salad, 
cornbread salad, and broccoli 
salad, just to name a few.  There 
will also be tea, coffee, and 
water.

Tickets are by donation and 
can be purchased ahead from 

school cafetorium.  The 
program will include patriotic 
speeches, entertainment by the 
elementary students (grades 2 - 
6), and a touching slide show 
presentation.  A reception is 
planned immediately following 
the program.

All Coke County veterans are 
urged to attend and be 
recognized for their unselfish 
contribution to our nation’s 
security.  Please notify RLISD at 
(325) 453-4555 so that they can 
be properly recognized during 
this year’s program.

The local TOPS (Take Off  
Pounds Sensibly) chapter will 
meet each Tuesday from 6 pm 
until 7:30 pm at the Southside 
Church of  Christ in Robert Lee.

For more information, call 
Virginia Alexander at 473-1528.


