
strawberries, milk

Fish sticks, mac and cheese, 
California blend, pears, milk

Breaded mozzarella sticks, 
marinara sauce, corn, salad, 
grapes, chocolate chip cookie, milk

(Continued on page 7)

David O’Dell - 5 carries for 
11 yards;

Jaxon Tavarez  -  1 carry for 5 
yards, 2 tackles;

Ryan Mendoza - 4 tackles  

French toast sticks or 
Cinnamon Toast Crunch, fruit, 
juice, milk

Breakfast bun or Cheerios, 
fruit, juice, milk

PBJ or Lucky Charms, fruit, 
juice, milk

Tornado or Trix, fruit, juice, 
milk

Pancake and sausage on a 
stick or Reese’s Puffs, fruit, 
juice, milk
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By Jose Morales
The Robert Lee Steers hosted 

the Irion County Hornets on 
October 21 in their third district 
game of  the season and fell 
short of  a win against a good 
Irion County team.

The Steers, from the 
beginning, faced a tough 
opponent as Irion County 
would go on and score on their 
first couple of  possessions to 
take an early lead at the end of  
the first quarter. The Steers 
continued to play hard in the 
second quarter, but a strong 
Hornet defense didn’t allow 
them to move the ball too far. 
The Hornets would continue 
their strong offensive drive and 
scored several more times to 
end the game at the half  by the 
mercy rule. The Steers will 
travel to Eden on October 28 to 
face the Bulldogs for their last 
game of  the regular season. 
Steer fans make the drive and 
show your support for your 
Robert Lee Steers as they look 
to finish the regular season with 
a win away from home.

WE BLEED ORANGE
STEER PRIDE!

Irion County - 2 yard run with 
8:18 left, PAT good;

Irion County - 37 yard run 
with 6:01 left, PAT fail;

Irion County - 23 yard pass 
with 3:43 left, PAT good;

Irion County - 1 yard run with 
1:49 left, PAT good;

Irion County - 30 yard run 
with :34 left; PAT Fail

Steers  - 0 
Irion County - 36 

Irion County - 26 yard pass 
with 9:13 left, PAT good;

Irion County - 6 yard pass 
with 4:42 left, PAT good;

Irion County - 48 yard run 
with :20 left;

Mercy rule.

Steers - 0 
Irion County - 58 

David Jowers - 1 tackle;
Braden Sherwood - 17 carries 

for 49 yards, 1 Rec for 4 yards;
Jose Heredia - 2 carries for 6 

yards, 3 tackles;

Hamburger, ranch beans, 
smiley fries, orange smiles, 
pudding, milk

Crispito, tomato cup, 
cucumbers, rosy applesauce, milk

Chili cheese totchos, 
cornbread, veggie cup, tots, 


