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and the public is invited to 
attend.

Please RSVP to Rosa Long at 
(325) 453-4555 by November 
15.

The Coke County Soil and 
Water District is currently 
hosting a tree sale. Several 
different species of  evergreen 
and hardwood trees are 
available this year.

Stop by the office at 214 E. 
7th Street in Robert Lee to pick 
up an order form and view 
pictures of  mature trees. Call 
(325) 453-2623 ext. 3 for more 
information. 

Coke County Kickapoo Water 
Control and Improvement 
District #1 will hold an election 
on January 9, 2018, for the 
purpose of  electing two 
directors.

Directors Dennie Braswell and 
Bob Ragsdale have filed for re-
election to the board.

The election will be held at 

Bronte City Hall.
For further information 

concerning the election, contact 
Clerk Fran Sonnenberg by 5 pm 
on Friday, November 24, 2017.

An account to benefit Tom 
Scates has been set up at the 
First National Bank in Bronte. 

The First United Methodist 
Church in Robert Lee will host a 
family movie night on Sunday, 
December 3, and screen The 
Polar Express.  The event will be 
held at the Family Life Center of  
the church, with doors opening 
at 4:30 pm and the movie 
beginning at 5:30 pm.

Nachos, popcorn, candy, and 
drinks will be available for 
purchase.  Proceeds will go to the 
Robert Lee Care Center 
Activity Department.

Everyone is encouraged to 
wear your jammies and bring 
chairs, blankets, pillows, etc. and 
make yourself  comfortable (the 
room has a concrete floor).

Rec Hall.  Information will 
include aging, survey methods, 
and identifying CWD.

If  you are interested in 
attending, please RSVP by 
November 3 for the first part or 
by November 10 for the second 
by contacting the Extension 
Office at (325) 453-2461 or 
morgan.runyan@ag.tamu.edu.  
A meal will also be included in 
the admission cost.

The annual Sterling County 
Hunters’ Appreciation Dinner 
will be held on Saturday, 
November 11, 2017, beginning 
at 6:30 pm.  The event will be 
held at the Sterling County 
Community Center.  A fajita 
supper with all the trimmings 
will be served.  The public is 
encouraged to attend.

One dollar raffle tickets will be 
sold for the chance to win one 
of  a selection of  high quality 
guns.  Guns will be raffled that 
evening, but you do not have to 
be present to win.

Local and area businesses will 
also have booths available.  For 
more information contact the 
Sterling County Extension 
Office at (325) 378-3181.

Robert Lee ISD will host their 
annual Thanksgiving meal on 
Tuesday, November 21, 2017, 
from 11 am until 12:30 pm. 
There is a small fee for the meal 

The annual Veterans Day 
Program, sponsored by Robert 
Lee ISD, will be held on Friday, 
November 10 at 9:30 am in the 
school cafetorium.

The program will include 
patriotic speeches, 
entertainment by the elementary 
choir and a slide show 
presentation.  The Beta Club 
and Spanish Club will jointly 
provide a reception immediately 
following the program for all 
veterans.

All Coke County veterans are 
urged to attend and be 
recognized for their unselfish 
contribution to our nation’s 
security.

 The Robert Lee/Silver Lions 
Club, joined by Coke County 4-
H members, will be hosting 
their annual Pancake Supper on 
Saturday, November 11, at the 
Robert Lee Rec Hall.

The menu will consist of  
pancakes, sausage, coffee, milk 
and orange juice. The price is 

$5 per plate and serving will be 
from 5:30 pm until 7:30 pm.

The proceeds from the 
pancake supper will benefit the 
local 4-H Club,  as well as the 
‘64 Study Club, who will be 
providing the desserts for the 
cake auction following the meal.

Everyone is invited and 
encouraged to come and enjoy 
an evening of  good food and 
fellowship.

Coke County Agrilife 
Extension is presenting a wildlife 
lunch and learn series with 
speaker Stoney Newberry, 
TPWD biologist for Runnels, 
Coleman, Concho, and Coke 
Counties.

The topic will be Feral Hogs 
on Tuesday, November 7, at 12 
noon at the Bronte Community 
Center.  Information will 
include habitat, possible modes 
for control, and  identification 
of  damage.

Deer management will be the 
topic of  the second part of  the 
series on Tuesday, November 14 
at 12 noon at the Robert Lee 


