
Headphones, Video Equipment, 
Cameras, Video Cameras, Web 
Cams, Communications 
Equipment, Medical Testing 
Equipment, Laboratory 
Equipment, Circuit Boards, 
Cables, Wires, Power Cords, and 
Power Strips.

The recycling is a free service 
provided by the City of  Bronte 
and Concho Valley Council of  
Government.

The Bronte Longhorn Golf  
Club is sponsoring a 2 person 27 
hole golf  tournament on 
Saturday, November 15.  Tee 
time is 9 am.

When signing up you must let 
them know if  a cart is needed 
and leave a call back number.  
For more information, contact 
Bronte Longhorn Golf  Club at 
325-473-2156, 325-473-3231 or 
325-262-6617. After 5 pm call 
432-661-3431 or 325-864-3312 
or 325-236-0089.

A Free Electronics Recycling 
for Coke County will be held 
Saturday, November 15, from 8 
am to 12 noon in Bronte.  The 
location is 116 West Jones, just 
south of  the water plant.

Examples of  what can be 
recycled include Computers 
(Desktop and Laptops), Printers, 
Computer Accessories (Mice, 
Keyboards, Web Cams, 
Speakers, Microphones), 
Computer Monitors (CRT, 
LCD, LED), Televisions (CRT, 
LED, LCD, Plasma, 3D), Fax 
Machines, Typewriters, 
Telephones, Cell Phones & 
Chargers, GPS Units, Pagers, 
PDAs, Tablets, Answering 
Machines, MP3 Players, 
Scanners, Radios, Boom Boxes, 
CD Players, External Hard 
Drives, Solid State Drives, SD 
Cards, Memory Cards, Card 
Readers, Speakers, 
Microphones, DJ Equipment, 
Receivers, Recording Devices, 

Cinnamon roll or cereal, 
toast/jelly, fruit, juice, milk

Pancake on stick or cereal, 
toast/jelly, fruit, juice, milk

Breakfast pizza or cereal, 
toast/jelly, fruit, juice, milk

Sausage & biscuit or cereal, 
toast/jelly, fruit, juice, milk

French toast sticks or cereal, 
toast/jelly, fruit, juice, milk

Chicken spaghetti, California 
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blend, garden salad, 
breadsticks, apple slices, milk

Chicken quesadilla, refried 
beans, garden salad, 
applesauce, salsa, milk

Turkey & dressing, sweet 
potatoes, green beans, snowball 
salad, roll, milk, pie

Soft beef  tacos, baby 
carrots, seasoned corn, salsa, 
orange smiles, milk

Popcorn chicken, roll, sweet 
potato fries, cucumbers, sliced 
peaches, milk

BRONTE SCHOOL NEWS

 The Junior Varsity Bronte Longhorns successfully faced off  against the 
Junior Varsity Robert Lee Steers this season in 6 man competitions.  Photo Courtesy of  Maranda Hood.

 The Lady Longhorn Volleyball team finished their 
season as Bi-District Champions.  The Ladies fell on Saturday to Windthorst in the Area round of  
playoffs.  Photo Courtesy of  Tammy Royall.
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