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Dear Santa,

What would you want my 
present to be? Santa please may 
I have twinkle toese. Allso an 
Elf on the shelf. Cool shirts and 
cool pants. Cute jewelry and 
zoomer new clean doll house. A 
boom ferby. Merry Christmas.

Jaclyn Broadbent
Dear Santa,

I want a skateboard. And I 
want to see your slegh, reindeer, 
and elves. I want a toy 
motorcycle. That I can drive. 
And the game nobee.

Joey Goddard love Santa
Dear Santa,

For Christmas this year I 
would like to have a phone and 
another furbie. And can you give 
some clothes to my mom? Can 
you give me some cowgirl 
boots? O can you say hi to 
Rudolph for me. Merry 
Christmas and a Happy New 
Year.

Ambree Mcginnis
Dear Santa,

Can I please have a toy 
quidzooka and a xbox360 with 
dead rising 3 please. And 
brothers in the Army xbox360 
game. Blackops war game 
please.

Your friend,
Dayton

Dear Santa,
Can I please have a American 

doll for Christmas. I would love 
that. I’m going to give you a 
surprise. A hint: two pieces of 
paper. Anyways have a Merry 
Christmas.

Sincerely,
Emily

Dear Santa,
How is rodoff? I hope he is 

doing good. How are you? What 
I want for Christmas is a snow 
globe that sings a tune. Next I 
want those long monster high 
shoes. Then I want new clothes 
and a new journal with a lock 
and a key. And a furbie boom. 
Then Modie wants a new 
scooter. Then I want to see you 
in my room and wake me up to 
see you. Next I want five turtles. 
And that is all.

Daysiah
P.S. Merry Christmas

 Mrs. Sterling Myers and her Robert Lee 
Elementary music students presented a wonderfully entertaining Christmas concert last week.

Dear Santa,
Could you please bring me a 

glow pet and a phone case, and 
a pair of socks? 

Anna
Dear Santa,

How are you and Mrs. Claus 
doing? I want a black bike, 
ipod, ipad, and Bla Blades and 
ring. 

Cole
Dear Santa,

I want a Nobi and Bad Kitty 
books. I love you. Thanks you 
for the stuff. 

Emery
Dear Santa,

Could you please bring me 
some for real toy dog? I want to 
see Rudolph.

Hannah

Dear Santa,
For Christmas I would like a 

phone, drums, guitars, and my 
brother would like a xbox with 
games. Xoxoxo I love Santa!

From,
Tryntin Parnell

   PS. I would like cloths for my 
hole family!
Dear Santa,

How are you and the 
reindeers? I hope it’s not so 
mutch trouble. I would like a 
phone. I want a new mattress 
because mine is hard. Wold you 
like a hard mattress. I wold like 
an ipad with a 3D movie with 
3D glasses and a belt. Allso 
about that ipod. Can you geive 
my sister one too because she 
dropped and cract it. I would 
like a elektrik scooter please. 

Love,
Ryana


