
management program. So 
whether you love them or simply 
love to hate them, let’s take a 
look at some of  the latest 
research regarding how high 
fences impact the movement of  
white-tailed deer.

A study in South Texas 
headed up by Texas AgriLife 
Research is interested in 
determining the home range of  
deer both inside and outside a 
high fenced area. To collect the 
necessary data on deer 
movements, researchers placed 
GPS collars on three does and 
three bucks inside and three 
does and three bucks outside a 
500 acre high fenced area. 
Collars collected location data 
every three hours for each deer 
for an entire year. So what did 
the first year of  the study find?

This may surprise many of  
you, but researchers found that 
the home range sizes of  collared 
bucks were similar on both sides 
of  the high fence. Both groups 
of  bucks, both inside and 
outside, had home range sizes of  
about 300 acres. Does, however, 
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By Buck Manager
They have become a part of  

the Texas landscape. 
Landowners that have them 
claim that they are critical for 
white-tailed deer management. 
Those that don’t either dislike 
them or simply can not afford 
them. Some people, hunters 
included, hate them. Hard 
working men make a living 
building them. “They” are high 
fences, often referred to as game 
fences. Like it or not, it seems 
high fences are here to stay, but 
a question that has undoubtedly 
crossed the minds of  many deer 
hunters is, “What impact does a 
high fence have on the 
movement of  white-tailed 
deer?”

Game fences are typically 8 or 
10 feet in height, so there are 
high fences and then really high 
fences. Ask just about anyone 
and they will tell you that high 
fences are deer proof—deer 
inside the fence can’t get out 
and deer outside the fence can’t 
get in. This belief  is disturbing 
to hunters and landowners 
bordering high fenced 
properties because it seems 
more and more ranches are 
turning to boundary fence that 
consist of  high fence. I can see 
both the pros and cons of  high 
game fences, but neither of  
them is so compelling that I 
want to drink to the proverbial 
Kool-Aid. That being said, high 
fences make it much easier to 
manage a deer herd.

If  high fences were banned 
then deer and habitat 
management would still take 
place. However, the fact is in 
many states, including Texas, 
that high fences are legal. As 
such, game fences are just 
another tool that a landowner 
can choose to use or not to use 
in their individual deer 


