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learning the Word, and 
worshiping the Risen Savior.

A Spring Italian Lunch will be 
held Sunday, April 11, 
beginning at 12 noon until sold 
out.  To-go plates of  Chicken 
Alfredo, Italian Bread, Salad, 
and Dessert will be sold at the 
Robert Lee Methodist Church 
Family Life Center.  All proceeds 
benefit the RL4Restoration 
Playground Project.

Vision with a Purpose will host 
their annual Trade Days on 
Saturday, May 1, in Robert Lee.  
For more information or to get a 
spot on the map, contact Nancy 
Wilson at (432) 413-4216 or 
email vprobertlee@gmail.com

RL4Restoration will hold their 
2nd Annual Spring Stampede 
on Saturday, May 1, 2021, at the 
large rec hall and outdoor 
pavilion in Robert Lee.  The 
event will include a pork 
tenderloin/pulled pork dinner 
beginning at 6:30 pm, dance 
kicking off  at 8 pm, and a silent 
auction.  Music for the dance 
will be provided by Robert 
Lee’s own Backroads West.  
Tickets for dinner and dance 
must be purchased in advance 

Palm Sunday Worship will be 
held on Sunday, March 28, at 11 
am.  This day is believed in the 
Christian faith as the day Jesus 
entered Jerusalem and is 
celebrated with palm fronds. 

Maundy Thursday Worship 
will be held on Thursday, April 
1, at 6 pm.  This day is believed 
in the Christian faith to be the 
day Jesus celebrated His final 
Passover. 

Good Friday Service is set for 
Friday, April 2, at 6 pm.  This 
day is celebrated as the 
Crucifixion of  Jesus Christ.

The Easter Sunrise Service 
will be held on Sunday, April 4, 
at 7 am at the Gentry Ranch 
(located 5 miles west of  Bronte 
on Highway 158). This is an 
annual event and  everyone is 
welcome!  The churches of  
Bronte join together for this 
service.  Because of  Covid the 
traditional breakfast will not be 
served.  Coffee and hot 
chocolate will be available.  As 
this is an outdoor event, dress for 
the unpredictable West Texas 
weather. A blanket would 
probably feel good this early in 
the morning. 

The Easter Worship Service 
will be at 11 am on April 4 in 
the First United Methodist 
Church sanctuary, with Pastor 
Stacy Sprinkle bringing the 
message and Lanette Fletcher 
leading the singing.  Everyone is 
always welcome.  Come, enjoy 

A Fish Fry Fundrasiser will be 
held on Saturday, March 27, 
beginning at 12 noon until sold 
out.  To-go plates of  the Burns’ 
Family Famous Fried Fish, will 
be sold at the Robert Lee 
Methodist Church Family Life 
Center.  All proceeds from the 
event benefit Robert Lee ISD 
student athletes through the 
Robert Lee Sports Boosters.

First Baptist Church of  Bronte 
will be hosting an Easter Egg 
Hunt on Saturday, March 27, at 
the Bronte Baseball Fields and 
Pavilion, beginning at 11:30 am.  
A bagged hot dog lunch will be 
provided after the egg hunt, as 
well as prize eggs and a drawing 
for a cornhole set.  Those 
attending are asked to please 
wear masks and practice social 
distancing.  For more 

information, call (325) 450-0891.

A Spring Market will be held 
on Saturday, March 27, from 10 
am until 4 pm at the Robert Lee 
Park Pavilion.  Vendors will be 
set up with items to purchase.

The West Coke County 
Hospital District Board of  
Directors will meet on Thursday, 
March 30, 2021.  The meeting 
will be held at 9 am at the Jail 
Annex in Robert Lee.

Holy Week is such an amazing 
time in our Christian faith.  If  
you do not have a church family 
or your church is not having 
Holy Week services, First United 
Methodist Church in Bronte 
would be so happy to have you 
in their church!

Stephen Salmon (left), representing the East Coke County Ambulance Service, accepts a 
$2500 donation from ExxonMobil Pipeline Company recently at the Coke County Courthouse in Robert 
Lee.  County Judge Hal Spain made the presentation.  Also included were $1,000 donations to both the
Robert Lee and Bronte Independent School Districts.

by Friday, April 23, and are 
available at Floyd C. Petitt 
Insurance, Ivey Motors, or from 
any RL4Restoration member.  
Tickets for the dance only may 
be purchased at the door.  The 
group is also seeking sponsors 
for the event.  If  you would like 
to become a sponsor, contact a 
RL4Restoration member by 
Friday, March 26.  Sponsors 
from the cancelled 2020 event 
will be honored.

Proceeds from the event will 
go towards the Coke County 
Playground Project.

West Coke County EMS will 
host a Meet and Greet event on  
Saturday, April 24, at 6 pm, at 
the Coke County Park and 
Pavilion in Robert Lee.  A meal 
of  chicken strips, gravy, and 
french fries will also be available 
for purchase.  Bring your lawn 
chairs and listen to some music 
after viewing the new 
ambulance.

A vendor event will be held at 
Blue Agave Cattle Company in 
Blackwell on Saturday, April 24, 
from 10 am until 7 pm.  If  you 
are a vendor and would like a 
registration form emailed to you, 
please contact Kristi Holland at 
(325) 338-3181 or Laci Wylie at 
(432) 413-8575.


