
Jeremy Watkins, Burglary of  a 
Building – Motion to Revoke 
Probation, February 1, 2017

Kenneth Kendrick, Driving 
While Intoxicated 3rd or More – 
Motion to Revoke Probation, 
February 3, 2017

Russell Vaughn, Driving While 
Intoxicated, Unlawful Carrying 
of  a Weapon, February 17, 2017

Jason Key, Driving While 
Intoxicated, February 24, 2017

The State of  Texas vs. Tyler 
Corley

Charge: Forgery Financial 
Instrument

Charge: Fraud Use/Poss 
Identifying Information

Plea: Guilty, 365 Days State 
Jail Probates 3 years both 
charges, $3630.82 Restitution 
Forgery Charge 

The State of  Texas vs. 
Cameron Fox

Charge: Driving While 
Intoxicated

Plea: Dismissed
*****

The State of  Texas vs. 
Cameron Fox

Charge: Possession of  
Marijuana less than 2oz

Plea: 12 Months Deferred 
Adjudication, $1,000 Fine, 
$322.00 Court Cost, Drug 
Offender Course

Responding to the increased 
number of  citizens wanting to 
assist law enforcement officials 
and build a stronger partnership 
in the fight against crime, 

The following reports were 
made by Coke County Sheriff’s 
Office for the month of  January 
2017.

7 Sheriff’s Information 
Reports

3 Civil Matters Calls
1 Class C Assault
1 Assault
1 Vandalism
1 Criminal Mischief  
1 Unauthorized use of  a 

Motor Vehicle
4 Welfare Checks
1 Theft of  a Firearm 

(Recovered)
1 Theft of  Fuel
1 Cruelty to Animals

(Includes Funerals, Court, 
Motorist Assist, and Alarm 
Calls, etc.)

5 Civil Process
8 Prisoner Transports, 

including arrest and to and from 
court

31 Livestock Calls
6 Accidents
1Accident Assist
78 Traffic Stops
54 Traffic Stops resulting in 

citations
3 Males in Runnels County 

Jail as of   Tuesday February 14, 
2017

The following reports were 
made by Coke County Sheriff’s 
Office for the month of  
February 2017.

5 Sheriff’s Information 
Reports

3 Civil Matters Calls
1 Class C Assault
1 Assault
2 Thefts
1 Criminal Mischief  
2 Welfare Checks
1 Burglary of  a Habitation

(Includes Funerals, Court, 
Motorist Assist, and Alarm 
Calls, etc.)

4 Civil Process
6 Prisoner Transports 

including arrest and to and from 
court

1 Warrant Served
40 Livestock Calls
7 Accidents
49 Traffic Stops
35 Traffic Stops resulting in 

citations
2 Male Inmates in Runnels 

County Jail as of  Monday 
March 13, 2017

Steven Shawn Cason, Driving 
While Intoxicated, January 13, 
2017

Nicklas Service, Assault 
Causing Bodily Injury, January 
16, 2017

The State of  Texas vs. Oscar 
Duran

Charge: Possession of  a 
Controlled Substance

Charge: Unauthorized use of  
a Motor Vehicle

Plea: Guilty, 180 days State 
Jail on both charges, $180 
Restitution on the Possession 
Charge

*****
The State of  Texas vs. Gabriel 

Ramirez
Charge: Unauthorized use of  

a Motor Vehicle
Plea: Guilty, $500 fine, 2 years 

deferred adjudication, $500 
Restitution
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Sheriff  Wayne McCutchen 
announced that Coke County 
citizens are being invited to 
become Associate Members of  
the Sheriffs’ Association of  
Texas.

Membership invitations will go 
out in the mail over the next 
several weeks.  Associate 
Member funding allows the 
Sheriffs Association of  Texas to 
provide critical training, 
technical resources, and 
legislative support on key 
criminal justice issues to law 
enforcement officers across the 
state.

In addition, dues will be used 
to support crime prevention and 
awareness programs, promote 
public safety, fight drug abuse, 
provide additional training for 
sheriffs and their deputies, and 
provide scholarships for children 
of  law enforcement officers.

Contributions to the Sheriffs’ 
Association of  Texas are tax-
deductible.

“The Associate Membership 
Drive helps provide the funding 
vital to our mission of  making 
our communities safer places to 
live, work and play,” said Sheriff  
McCutchen.

The Association Membership 
Program was created to provide 
citizens with an opportunity to 
lend their support to more 
effective law enforcement and to 
better help local Sheriffs protect 
the lives and property of  citizens.

“During these economic times, 

the need for building stronger 
public-private law enforcement 
partnerships continues to 
escalate, and programs like this 
continue to grow in 
importance,” McCutchen said.  
“I encourage every citizen 
receiving a membership appeal 
to consider joining forces with us 
by becoming an Associate 
Member.  It is a valuable 
investment in our future.”

Citizens not receiving a 
membership appeal or desiring 
more information can 

Nearly half  a million acres of  
the Texas Panhandle burned. 
Homes, barns and fences 
burned. Some lost livestock. 
Others lost their lives.

Now that the fires are out, 
farmers, ranchers and 
landowners are working to 
rebuild. But they need help.

“Some people lost everything,” 
John Ross Copeland, Coke 
County Farm Bureau president, 
said. “To help our neighbors get 
back on their feet, Texas Farm 
Bureau (TFB) has developed a 
Panhandle Wildfire Relief  Fund 
for tax-deductible donations to 
meet the needs in the 
Panhandle.”

Following the fires, farmers 
and ranchers from across Texas 
and neighboring states trucked 
hay and other donations to the 
Panhandle. As of  March 13, hay 

(Continued on page 7)
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