
Access Coordinator. “We are 
really excited about this 
opportunity to create more 
private-public partnerships while 
expanding public access to the 
exceptional fishing and paddling 
resources that Texas rivers and 
creeks provide.”

The objective for TPWD is to 
establish lease agreements with 
landowners, resulting in 
increased river access for both 
anglers and paddlers. Since 
2012, 24 public river access 
leases have been established with 
cooperating landowners. These 
agreements for access area use 
enabled or enhanced paddling 
and river fishing on more than 
211 miles of  10 different rivers 

across Texas. Find out more 
information and review 
descriptions of  all the 
outstanding river access areas 
supported through the leased 
access program by visiting the 
TPWD River Fishing page.

River Access and 
Conservation Areas are funded 
by a combination of  sources 
including donations from the 
Texas Parks and Wildlife 
Foundation, sales of  the Texas 
Rivers Conservation License 
Plate, and grant awards through 
the U.S. Farm Bill and Wildlife 
and Sport Fish Restoration 
Program.

For more information or to 
submit an application, please see 
the River Access Request for 
Applications on the TPWD 
Grants Page. Landowners 
interested in partnering with 
TPWD in this effort can gain 
additional valuable insight into 
the program by checking out 
this fact sheet that answers some 
of  the more frequently asked 
questions.

Landowners are encouraged 
to apply at any time, however, to 
receive preference for 2021 
funding cycle, applications 
should be received by 
September 30, 2020.

in the third week of  June.  The 
average daily fatality number 
was 22 during the last week of  
May and first week of  June 
before it dropped slightly to 20 
in the second week of  June.  But 
it rose to 28 in the third week of  
June.

However although the daily 
recovery figure was higher, the 
recovered percentage fell from 
the last week in May (65.12%) to 
the third week in June (63.84).  It 
was highest during the first week 
in June at 66.77%.  This was 
due to the jump in new cases.

Daily new cases averaged 
1,277 per day during the last 
week of  May.  They rose to 
1,527 per day the first week of  
June, 1,839 per day the second 
week of  June and spiked to 
3,392 the third week of  June.

Of  course daily testing also 
spiked the third week in June.  
Average daily testing in Texas 
for the last week in May was 
28,306.  It was 26,058 and 
29,707 respectively for the first 
two weeks in June.  The third 
week in June, this number rose 
dramatically to average almost 
36,000 tests per day (35,903).  

Daily new cases can’t really be 
considered without the daily 
testing factored in.  This 
percentage was 6.03% the last 
week of  May.  It fell the first two 
weeks in June to 5.95% and 

5.93% before increasing to 
6.25% the third week in June.  
This showed an increase of  
.22% for the time period.

The daily active case figure 
averaged only 399 per day 
during the last week of  May.  It 
rose the first two weeks in June to 
543 and 552, respectively, before 
spiking to 2,208 the third week 
of  June. The high daily 
percentage of  active cases was 
the last week in May at 3.48%.  
This percentage fell during the 
first two weeks of  June to 3.06% 
and 3.14%, respectively.  The 
third week of  June didn’t go as 
high as 3.48%, but it came close 
at 3.40%.

The daily hospitalization 
figures were very disheartening.  
The average daily number of  all 
those in Texas hospitalized due 
to Covid-19 was 1,645 for the 
last week in May, rising each 
week to 2,912 the third week in 
June.  The average daily new 
hospitalization figure rose from 
35 the last week in May to 111 
during the third week in June.  
Even the daily hospitalization 
percentage rose during the time 
period from 2.76% to 2.89% for 
an increase of  .13%.

Good news was heard during 
this time period in the form of  
Covid-19 treatments, both for mild 
to moderate cases and treatment 
for the most severe cases.

As Re-Open Texas continues, 
Covid-19 cases are still 
increasing within the state.  In 
Coke County, we are now at 4 
confirmed cases with 1 fatality 
and 3 considered to be active.  A 
look at our neighboring counties 
shows dramatically increasing 
numbers in San Angelo (Tom 
Green County) with 192 
confirmed cases, 111 of  which 
are active; 3 confirmed cases in 
Runnels County with 0 active 
cases; Taylor County has 289 

confirmed cases, 31 of  which 
are active; Nolan County has 13 
confirmed, 7 of  which are 
active; and Mitchell County has 
2 confirmed cases, 1 of  which is 
active.  Sterling County is our 
only neighboring county to have 
not had any confirmed cases of  
Covid-19.

Only two of  the eleven 
categories were improvements 
on numbers prior to the end of  
May.  The two bright spots are 
the average daily new recoveries 

and the fatality percentage.  
Daily new recoveries averaged 
1,149 per day the last week of  
May, 1,014 per day the first 
week of  June, 1,235 per day the 
second week of  June and 1,659 
the third week of  June.  This 
shows we are averaging 500 
recoveries a day more than we 
did the end of  May.  The fatality 
percentage averaged 2.67% the 
last week of  May and fell to 
2.51% and 2.33% the first and 
second weeks of  June and 
continuing the fall to 2.16% the 
third week of  June.  This 
percentage dropped over one 
half  percent during this time 
period.  Unfortunately, the daily 
new fatality averages increased 


