
asegurar que la falta de 
habilidad en el uso de la lengua 
inglés no sea un obstaculo para 
la admisión y participación en 
todos los programas educativos y 
vocacionales.

Para información sobre sus 
derechos o procedimientos para 
quejas, comuníquese con el 
Coordinator del Título IX, 
Aaron Hood, y/o el 
Coordinador de la Sección 504, 
Aaron Hood, en Robert Lee 
ISD, 1323 Hamilton, Robert 
Lee, TX , 325/453-4555.
06-1tc

(Continued from page 3)
$443,378.87

Cities maintain the 
infrastructure (water, sewer, trash 
collection, city streets, etc.) 
necessary to communities to 
exist.  The city councils also pass 
laws, in the form of  ordinances, 
to protect health, welfare and 
safety of  their citizens.  The 
cities each receive rebates of  a 
portion of  the sales taxes 
collected from the businesses 
within their city limits.  They 
also receive revenue from the 
water, sewer and trash 
collection.
2014 Taxes Levied
City of  Bronte-$98,085.73
City of  Robert Lee-$111,689.22

Their purpose is the most 
obvious-to provide access to 
education for every child in their 
district.  Several years ago, 
Bronte dropped the additional 
20% discount given to 
homeowners.  The state 
mandates a $15,000 homestead 
exemption which applies to 
taxpayers in each school’s 
district.  However, Robert Lee 
also gives the additional 20% 
discount.  Both schools have a 
freeze for those receiving the 
Over 65 exemption.  For this 
group, their school taxes were 
frozen either at or below the 
dollar amount they paid when 
they were first eligible for the 
Over 65 exemption.  Cities and 
counties may also offer this 
freeze to their senior citizens.  
The cities of  Bronte and Robert 
Lee and Coke County do not 
offer this option.
2014 Taxes Levied

The Robert Lee Independent 
School District offers career and 
technology education programs 
in Agriculture and 
Homemaking.  Admission to 
these programs is open to all 
students enrolled in Robert Lee 
High School.  

It is the policy of  Robert Lee 
ISD not to discriminate on the 
basis of  race, color, national 
origin, sex, handicap, or age, in 
its employment practices as 
required by Title VI of  the Civil 
Rights Act of  1964, amended, 
Title IX of  the Educational 
Amendments of  1972, the Age 
Discrimination Act of  1975, as 
amended and Section 504 of  the 
Rehabilitation Act of  1973, as 
amended.

Robert Lee Independent 
School District will take steps to 
assure that the lack of   English 
language skills will not be a 
barrier to admission and 
participation in all educational 
and vocational programs.

For more information about 
your rights to grievance 
procedures, contact the Title IX 
coordinator, Aaron Hood, 
Robert Lee ISD, Robert Lee, 
Texas, 325/453-4555 or the 
Section 504 coordinator, Aaron 
Hood, Robert Lee ISD, Robert 
Lee, Texas, 325/453-4555.

Robert Lee ISD ofrece 
programas vocacionales en 
Agriculture y Home Economics.  
La admission a estos programs 
se basea esta abier para todas 
estudiantes en Robert Lee High 
School.

Es norma de Robert Lee ISD 
no discriminar por motivos de 
raza, color, origen nacional, 
sexo, impedimento o edad, en 
sus procedimientos de empleo, 
tal como lo requieren el Título 
VI de la Ley de Derechos Civiles 
de 1964, según enmienda; el 
Título IX  de las Enmiendas en 
la Educación, de 1972, la ley de 
Discriminación por Edad, de 
1975, según enmienda, y la 
Sección 504 de la Ley de 
Rehabilitación de 1973, según 
enmienda.

Robert Lee ISD tomará las 
medidas necesarias para 
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