
for Sterling County Nursing 
Home.  Starting wages $12.00/
hour plus shift differentials and 
mileage allowance.  Excellent 
retirement and insurance. Call 
Ashley Porter or Amanda Arispe 
at 325-378-2134.

49-tnc

Great Pay! 100% PAID Health 
Ins! Quarterly & Annual 
Bonuses!
 Regional & Long Haul 
Openings! CDL - A, 1 yr w/
Tank-Haz End
 100% Employee 
Owned Martin Transport 1-844-
527-5285.

04-4twp

is accepting applications for a 
part-time deputy city secretary.  
Salary based on experience.  
High School diploma or 
equivalent required.  Office 
skills, bookkeeping skills, and 
computer experience required.  
Bilingual skills preferred but not 
required.   Applications can be 
picked up at the City Hall.  
Applications will be received 
until August 8th.  The City of 
Bronte is an equal opportunity 
employer.

04-2tc

Someone to mow, weed eat, 
and haul away a lot of brush.  
Give me an estimate.  Call Bill 
at (325) 453-4658.

05-2tc

On Crowe Ranch off Cox 
Road near Robert Lee. 2-3 year 
old Black Angus bull, no brand 
or eartag.  For more information, 
call Coke County Sheriff’s 
Office at (325) 453-2717.

05-2tp

Friday, Saturday and Sunday, 
August 8-10.  510 State Street in 
Bronte.

05-1tp

Notice is hereby given that 
original Letters Testamentary 
for the Estate of Ralph E. 
Williams were issued on July 
28, 2014, in Cause No. 
PR1401807, pending in the 
County Court of Coke County, 
Texas, to Robert Williams.

Claims may be presented in 
care of the attorney for the 
Estate addressed as follows:

Robert Williams
Independent Executor

Estate of Ralph E. Williams, 
Deceased

c/o Larry W. Bale
P.O. Box 271

San Angelo, TX 76902-0271
All persons having claims 

against this Estate which is 
currently being administered are 
required to present them within 
the time and in the manner 
prescribed by law.

DATED July 30, 2014.

323 Key St--Corner lot 
professionally landscaped 4br/
3ba, 2442 sq ft home, 2 car 
garage & carport. San Angelo 
Real Estate 325-277-7653 Janie 
Thomas. $214,400.

44-tnc

Has storage buildings for rent.  
473-2221, 473-0409.

45-tnc

Handyman.  Call for more
information about services. 
Kenneth Prine  (325) 453-2339.

27-tnc

HAY, WITTENBURG, DAVIS, 
CALDWELL & BALE, L.L.P.

By:
Larry W. Bale

State Bar No. 01629830
P.O. Box 271

San Angelo, TX 76902-0271
325-658-2728/325-655-2278 

(fax)
05-1tc

Bob FrazeeÕs 944-0010473-6603

Deflooding &Carpet Cleaning

24 hr. Emergency
Water Damage Service

Texas Best
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FOR SALE
EQUAL HOUSING

OPPORTUNITY

BUY IT!  SELL IT!  FIND IT!

FOR RENT

GARAGE SALES

o-e@wcc.net

PUBLISHER’S NOTICE:
All real estate advertising in 

this newspaper is subject to 
the Fair Housing Act which 
makes it illegal to advertise 
“any preference, limitation or 
discrimination based on race, 
color, religion, sex, handicap, 
familial status or national origin, 
or an intention, to make any 
such preference, limitation or 
discrimination.”  Familial status 
includes children under the 
age of 18 living with parents or 
legal custodians, pregnant 
women and people securing 
custody of children under 18.

This newspaper will not 
knowingly accept any 
advertising for real estate 
which is in violation of the law.  
Our readers are hereby 
informed that all dwellings 
advertised in this newspaper 
are available on an equal 
opportunity basis.  To complain 
of discrimination, call HUD toll-
free at 1-800-669-9777.  The 
toll-free telephone number for 
the hearing impaired is 1-800-
927-9275.

NOTICES

CLASSIFIED 
ADVERTISING RATES
Rates when paid in advance.

25¢ Per Word
$5 Minimum
Legal Notices:
35¢ Per Word

A service charge will be 
added to all ads which 

must be billed.
ADVERTISING

DEADLINE
Tuesday at 10 am

HELP WANTED

Jackie Walker (Rep.)

Paul Williams (Rep.)
WANTED

Grady Coulter (Dem.)

Roy Blair (Rep.)

TonyÕs
Wrench

MISCELLANEOUS

For our Bronte 
customers’ 

convenience, there is 
a Drop Box at

Bronte
Hardware Store.

FOUND


