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reception for 9 yards;
Stephen Oleksiuk - 5 tackles;
Hunter Jowers - 4 tackles,  2 

fumble recoveries with 1 TD;
Kyler Coger - 3 tackles;
Daniel Mendoza - 5 carries for 

47 yards and 1 TD, 1 of  3 
passing for 9 yards, 1 reception 
for 34 yard TD and 8 tackles;

Nathan Scates - 3 carries for 
18 yards and 1 TD and 5 
tackles;

Jayton Warren - 2 carries for 
7, 1 reception for 27 yards and 1 

Steers - 29 yard pass from 
Fowler to Skipworth with 5:04 
left, PAT failed;

Steers - 1 yard run by Scates 
with 2:47 left, PAT failed;

Steers - 28 yard fumble return 
by Fowler with 2:38 left, PAT 
failed.

Steers - 66
Mountaineers - 0

Manny Gamboa - 1 of  2 
passing for 34 yards and 1 TD, 1 

Robert Lee ISD will celebrate 
homecoming October 26, 2018, 
kicking off  with a parade 
downtown at 2 pm.  Following 
the parade, a pep rally will be 
held at 2:40 pm in the new gym 
at Robert Lee High School.  
FCCLA will sponsor a pre-game 
dinner in the Cafetorium from 5 
pm until 7 pm, followed by pre-
game activities at the stadium 
starting at 7:10.  Beginning at 
7:30 pm, the Coke County 
Rivalry will take place once 
again as the Steers face off  
against the Bronte Longhorns.

by Tom Sawyer
The Steers hosted the Santa 

Anna Mountaineers Friday night 
and added their third straight 
victory of  the season.  Robert 
Lee opened up their first 
offensive play with a score and 
never looked back. 

This Friday, September 21, the 
Steers will travel to San Marcos 
to play the San Marcos Hill 

Country Christian School at 
6:30 pm.  This game will be a 
long trip for Robert Lee and the 
Steers would appreciate anyone 
that can make the trip to be safe 
and come cheer on the Steers.

WE BLEED ORANGE
STEER PRIDE

Steers - 28 yard run by Fowler 
with 7:32 left, PAT failed;

Steers - 12 yard run by 
Skipworth with 6:35 left, PAT 
kick by Skipworth;

Steers - 34 yard pass from 
Gamboa to Mendoza with 6:02 
left, PAT kick by 
Skipworth;

Steers - 7 yard run by 
Mendoza with 4:41 left, PAT 
failed;

Steers - 52 yard run by Jowers 
with 4:00 left, PAT kick by 
Skipworth.

Steers - 36
Mountaineers - 0

Steers - 27 yard pass from 
Skipworth to Warren with 9:43 
left, PAT kick by Skipworth;

Steers - Safety with 8:51 left;
Steers - Safety with 5:27 left;

TD, 2 tackles and 1 interception;
Lane Fowler - 2 carries for 27 

yards and 1 TD, 1 of  2 passing 
for 29 yards and 1 TD, 1 tackle 
and 1 fumble recovery for TD;

Kaleb Gregston - 1 tackle;
Casey Skipworth - 1 carry for 

12 yards, 1 of  1 passing for 27 
yard TD, 1 reception for 29 yard 
TD, 3 tackles and 1 fumble 
recovery;

Bryce Raynor - 11 tackles and 
1 fumble recovery.
GO STEERS - STEER PRIDE

 Robert Lee High School students were recently presented with their lettermen 
jackets at the first pep rally of  the school year.


