
Accountability, the annual audit 
and the cafeteria audit.
 The next regular board meeting 
will be Tuesday, October 17, 
2017, at 5 pm.
  The meeting was adjourned at 
5:45 pm.

(Continued from page 4)
Bulldogs - 5 yard run with 

3:32 left, PAT kick good.

Steers - 38
Bulldogs - 68

Lane Fowler  - 3 carries, 10 of  
17 passing for 61 yards and 4 
tackles;

Hunter Jowers - 1 reception 
for 7 yds. and 8 tackles;

Daniel Mendoza - 9 carries 
for 30 yds., 4 receptions for 
11yds. and  10 tackles;

Nathan Scates - 2 receptions 
for 17 yards and 3 tackles;

Bubba Bohannon - 1 

Chopped BBQ sandwich, 
pickle spears, coleslaw, chips, 
fruit, milk

Grilled chicken breast, chicken 
flavored rice, broccoli 
normandy, cheddar biscuit, fruit, 
milk

Chicken fajitas, Spanish rice, 
refried beans, salad, fruit, milk

Pancake wrap, yogurt, fruit, 
juice, milk

Chicken-n-biscuit, fruit, juice, 
milk

Breakfast pizza, fruit, juice, 
milk

Biscuit, gravy, eggs, bacon, 
fruit, juice, milk

Biscuit and sausage, fruit, 
juice, milk

Pizza, corn, red bell pepper 
strips, tomato cup, fruity gelatin, 
milk

Head Start - pizza, seasoned 
corn, fruity gelatin, milk

Chili cheese combo, fresh 
veggie cup, mixed fruit, milk

Head Start - chili cheese 
combo, sliced fresh veggies, 
mixed fruit, milk

Taquito and queso, salsa, 
charro beans, seasoned corn, 
seasonal fruit, fruit crisp, milk

Head Start - taquito and queso, 
charro beans, seasoned corn, 
sliced seasonal fruit, milk

Asian stir-fry, flatbread, salad, 
apple slices, milk

Head Start - Asian stir-fry, 
flatbread, apple slices, milk

Hamburger, garnish, cucumber 
slices, baby carrots, cinnamon 
applesauce, milk

Head Start - hamburger, 
garnish, cucumber slices, 
cinnamon applesauce, milk

(Continued from page 3)
 Superintendent Aaron Hood 
recommended purchasing a 29 
Passenger Micro Bird school bus 
through TASB Buyboard, with 
the cost being $60,915.  George 
Grim made the motion to 
approve the recommendation 
and was seconded by Irma 
Torres.  All were for.
 Superintendent Aaron Hood 
recommended accepting a 
proposal from Solar One.  Jeffie 
Roberts made a motion to allow 
Superintendant Aaron Hood to 
enter into negotiations with 
Solar One and the motion was 
seconded by Tom Sawyer.  All 
were for.
 Superintendent Aaron Hood 
recommended paying off  the 
loan at Robert Lee State Bank as 
soon as funds are received from 
TEA.  George Grim made the 
motion to approve the  
recommendation and was 
seconded by Beverly Sinclair.  
All were for.
 Superintendent Aaron Hood 
gave his report on ACT District 
Comparison, 2017 
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reception for 12 yds. and 2 
tackles;

Isaiah Smith - 17 carries for 
244 yds. and 5TD’s, 2 receptions 
for 14 yds., and 9 tackles;

Casey Skipworth - 1 tackle;
Johnny Skipworth - 4 PAT 

kicks.
GO STEERS - 
STEER PRIDE

Robert Lee’s Homecoming 
game is this week at 7:30 pm 
against Highland.

The Bronte Longhorns 
travelled to McCamey this last 
Friday to take on the Badgers. 
The Longhorns fell to the 
Badgers 54-0.

Defensively, the Longhorns 
suffered from poor tackling. On 
offense, the Longhorns moved 
the ball but could not finish 
drives in the end zone.

The Longhorns are back at 
home this week for homecoming 

ball 14 times for 14 yards;
Wayne Riley - carried the ball 

3 times for 16 yards;
Judah Smith - carried the ball 

2 times for 2 yards;
Zane Avants - one carry for 4 

yards;
Dylan Thomas - one carry for 

8 yards.

Zane Avants - 1 for 1 for 3  yards;
Michael Munoz - 0 for 3, no 

yards.

Caleb Smith - 1 catch for 3 
yards.

Reid Crisp - 5;
Dylan Thomas - 1;
Zane Avants - 1;
Michael Munoz - 2;
Wayne Riley - 2, with one for 

loss;
Fernando Sosa - 1.

against the Irion County 
Hornets on Friday at 7:30.

The Robert Lee Junior High 
Dogies were pinned deep on 
their first possession, could not 
move the ball and turned it over 
on downs at the 16.  Ira took it 
in from 16 out to go up 7-0.  The 
Dogies then fumbled on the 13 
on their next possession and Ira 
scored from the 13 yard line to 
make it 14-0.

In the second quarter, Ira 
scored two more times to go in 
up 28-0 at the half.  It didn’t get 
any better for the Dogies in the 
second half  as Ira scored once in 
the third and twice in fourth 
quarter to make the final score 
46-0.

Michael Munoz - carried the 


