
program can be made through 
the Social Services office of  the 
Robert Lee Care Center.  This 
notice is made in compliance 
with the plan administration for 
annual public notification of  
service availability.
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The Bronte Sorosis Study 
Club held its first meeting of  the 
year Thursday, September 15, 
2016, at the home of  Pat Lee.

Officers for the next two years 
are as follows:  President, Mary 
Percifull; First Vice President, 
Janet Wommack; Second Vice 
President, Marilyn Bivins; Third 
Vice President, Doris Sims; 
Secretary, Fran Crumpler; 
Reporter, Pat Lee; Treasurer, 
Denise Gallaway; and Historian, 
Pat Martindale.

Yearbooks were passed out 
and plans for the year were 
discussed.  The club has already 
donated $1,000 to the city of  

shall be charged the following 
rate with one collection per 
week:

3 yard container 1x per 
week - $51.34

3 yard container 2x per 
week - $82.80     

(2x per week is special rate 
established when service was 
reduced to 3 yard containers 
and one collection per week.)

This ordinance was duly 
passed by affirmative vote and 
shall take effect with the utility 
billing issued for the month of  
October, 2016. 

PASSED AND APPROVED 
this the 8th day of  August, 2016.

CITY OF ROBERT LEE
ATTEST:                                                                                   

Leroy Casey, Mayor
Kay Torres, City Secretary
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West Coke County Hospital 
District of  Robert Lee, Texas 
will provide from October 1, 
2016 to Sept. 30, 2017 Indigent 
Health Care service to all 
eligible persons who meet the 
Hospital District eligibility 
requirements. Any resident of  
West Coke County Hospital 
District is eligible to apply for 
these services. Eligibility criteria 
include household composition, 
income and other available 
resources. Supporting 
documentation is required for all 
components of  eligibility. 
Eligibility for Indigent Health 
Care services will be limited to 
persons who can prove residency 
in the West Coke County 
Hospital District and whose 
family income meets the criteria 
of  the current poverty income 
guidelines established by the 
Texas Department of  Health 
and shown to be effective March 
2015. Application for this 
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NOTICES
...More Classifieds Bronte for purchasing Christmas 

lights.  The club will furnish 
brownies and cookies for the 
Homecoming Tailgate Dinner at 
the school.  Also, they will help 
with the clean-up after the meal.

The card game of  “Crazy 
Bridge” was played and enjoyed 
by all.  Lanette Fletcher won the 
prize for having the highest 
score.

Pizza, coconut cake, and iced 
tea were served to seventeen 
members and one guest. 
Members were Pat Bedford, 
Marilyn Bivins, Fran Crumpler, 
Jane Cumbie, Lanette Fletcher, 
Denise Gallaway, Merle Kelso, 
Pat Martindale, Mary Percifull, 
Martha Ratliff, Cynthia 
Robinson, Beverly Sims, Doris 
Sims, Teresa Swecker, Jerita 
Taylor, Janet Wommack, and 
Pat Lee.  Terri Irwin was the 
meeting’s visitor.

The next meeting will be 
October 20, 2016, at the home 
of  Martha Ratliff.

For our 
Bronte 

customers’ 
convenience, 

there is a Drop 
Box at

SHIRLEY’S 
PLACE

in
Downtown 

Bronte 
on US Hwy 

277.


